
CAR SERBIA - Workplan (January – June 2012) 
 

January February March April May June 

1.1 Establishing Task 
Force 

1.2 Assisting TF to 
prepare 
amendments of the 
existing legislation 

1.2 Assisting TF to 
prepare amendments 
of the existing 
legislation 

1.2 Assisting TF to 
prepare amendments 
of the existing 
legislation 

1.2 Assisting TF to 
prepare 
amendments of the 
existing legislation 

1.2 Assisting TF to 
prepare amendments 
of the existing 
legislation 

4.1 Media training 
session (Nis) 

1.3 Impact study on the 
non-conviction 
based forfeiture 

1.3 Impact study on the 
non-conviction based 
forfeiture 

1.3 Impact study on the 
non-conviction based 
forfeiture 

1.3 Impact study on the 
non-conviction 
based forfeiture 

1.3 Impact study on the 
non-conviction based 
forfeiture 

  2.1 Scoping mission to 
design DMSCA 
training curricula  

2.2 Designing training 
curricula for DMSCA 

2.2 Designing training 
curricula for DMSCA 

2.4 Designing training 
curricula for FIU 

2.4 Designing training 
curricula for FIU 

    2.3 Scoping mission to 
design training 
curricula for FIU 

2.4 Designing training 
curricula for FIU 

2.5 Scoping missions to 
design training 
curricula for judges 

2.6 Designing training 
curricula for Judges 

    3.1 Study visit to Spain 2.7 Training on “Criminal 
Asset Recovery and 
ECtHR” for judges 
SCC 

2.8 Specialized training 
on financial investi-
gations for prose-
cutors (Novi Sad) 

  

    4.1 Media training session 
(Novi Sad) 

4.1 Media training 
session (Belgrade) 

3.2 Conference “Euro-
pean best practice in 
AR and exchange of 
information” 

  

  4.2 Designing media 
communication 
strategy guidelines 

4.2 Designing media 
communication 
strategy guidelines 

4.2 Designing media 
communication 
strategy guidelines 

4.2 Designing media 
communication 
strategy guidelines 

  

  5.1 Establishing Task 
Force for the 
customization of the  
software 

5.2 Supporting TF in 
assisting  DMSCA 
and FIU   

5.2 Supporting TF in 
assisting  DMSCA 
and FIU   

5.2 Supporting TF in 
assisting  DMSCA 
and FIU   

5.2 Supporting TF in 
assisting  DMSCA 
and FIU   

  6.1 Steering Committee 
meeting 

    6.1 Steering Committee 
meeting 

  

  6.2 Co-ordination body 
meeting 

    6.2 Co-ordination body 
meeting 

  

  6.3 Project Team 
consultations with 
key partners and 
donor 

6.3 Project Team 
consultations with 
key partners and 
donor 

6.3 Project Team 
consultations with 
key partners and 
donor 

  6.3 Project Team 
consultations with 
key partners and 
donor 

  6.4 Regular coordination 
meetings of the IOs 
in the AR field 

  6.4 Regular coordination 
meetings of the IOs in 
the AR field 

6.3 Project Team 
consultations with 
key partners & 
donor 

6.4 Regular coordination 
meetings of the IOs in 
the AR field 

  6.5 Translation and 
distribution of the 
relevant EU regula-
tions in the AR field 

6.5 Translation and 
distribution of the 
relevant EU regula-
tions in the AR field 

6.5 Translation and 
distribution of the 
relevant EU regula-
tions in the AR field 

    

 
ER 1          ER 2       ER 3 ER 4     ER 5       Complementary activities   

    


